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1 The record is defined in § 207.2(f) of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and Procedure (19 
CFR 207.2(f)). 

Further, the information will enable 
Federal agencies to determine customer 
satisfaction metrics with discrimination 
capability across variables. Thus, this 
information collection will assist 
Federal agencies in making the best use 
of resources in a targeted manner to 
improve service to the public. 

This survey asks no questions of a 
sensitive nature, such as sexual 
behavior and attitudes, religious beliefs, 
or other matters that are commonly 
considered private. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
unless it is operating under a currently 
valid Office of Management and Budget 
control number. The Office of 
Management and Budget control 
number for this collection is 1090–0008. 
The control number will be displayed 
on the surveys used. For expeditious 
administration of the surveys, the 
expiration date will not be displayed on 
the individual instruments. Response to 
the surveys is voluntary. 

Title of Collection: E-Government 
Website Customer Satisfaction Surveys. 

OMB Control Number: 1090–0008. 
Form Number: None. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents/Affected Public: 

Individuals/households. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Respondents: 250 with 5,000 
respondents per survey. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Responses: 1,250,000. 

Estimated Completion Time per 
Response: 2.5 minutes. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Burden Hours: 52,083. 

Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
Frequency of Collection: Once per 

survey. 
Total Estimated Annual Nonhour 

Burden Cost: None. 
An agency may not conduct, or 

sponsor and a person is not required to 
respond to a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid OMB 
control number. 

The authority for this action is the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. 3501 et seq.). 

Jeffrey Parrillo, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08427 Filed 4–22–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4334–63–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Bureau of Reclamation 

[RR03240000, XXXR4079V4, 
RX122562102010000] 

Termination of Notice of Intent To 
Prepare an Environmental Impact 
Statement, New Mexico Unit of the 
Central Arizona Project; Catron, Grant, 
and Hidalgo Counties, New Mexico 

AGENCY: Bureau of Reclamation, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Notice of termination. 

SUMMARY: The Bureau of Reclamation 
(Reclamation) is terminating preparation 
of an Environmental Impact Statement 
(EIS) for the New Mexico Unit of the 
Central Arizona Project (CAP) (NM 
Unit). A Notice of Intent to prepare an 
EIS was published on June 12, 2018. 
Reclamation, as the lead Federal agency, 
and the New Mexico Interstate Stream 
Commission (ISC), as joint lead agency, 
issued a Draft EIS for public review on 
April 24, 2020. On October 15, 2020, the 
ISC, Reclamation, and the New Mexico 
CAP Entity terminated the Interim 
Advance Funding Agreement, which 
funded the NM Unit EIS process. 
DATES: The preparation of the EIS for 
the NM CAP is discontinued as of the 
date of publication of this notice. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Leslie Meyers, Bureau of Reclamation, 
Phoenix Area Office, 6150 West 
Thunderbird Road, Glendale, AZ 
85306–4001; telephone (623) 773–6211; 
facsimile (623) 773–6480; email 
lmeyers@usbr.gov. Persons who use a 
telecommunications device for the deaf 
may call the Federal Relay Service at 1 
(800) 877–8339 TTY/ASCII to contact 
the above individual during normal 
business hours or to leave a message or 
question(s) after hours. You will receive 
a reply during normal business hours. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Arizona Water Settlements Act, Public 
Law 108–451 (AWSA), amended the 
Colorado River Basin Project Act of 
1968, Public Law 90–537, 43 U.S.C. Ch. 
32, authorizing the Secretary of the 
Interior (Secretary) to contract with 
water users in New Mexico for water 
from the Gila River, its tributaries and 
underground water sources. Water use 
under the AWSA is conditioned on 
satisfying a variety of laws and 
agreements related to its use in New 
Mexico and Arizona. 

The AWSA authorized the Secretary 
to design, build, operate, and maintain 
a NM Unit to divert Gila River water in 
New Mexico for this purpose. The 
Secretary was further directed to carry 

out all necessary environmental 
compliance required by Federal law in 
implementing the Consumptive Use and 
Forbearance Agreement and the New 
Mexico Unit Agreement, which would 
enable an exchange of CAP water to 
downstream Gila River water users in 
Arizona, for diversion and use of the 
Gila River in the NM Unit project area 
in southwestern New Mexico. 

On November 18, 2016, an Interim 
Advance Funding Agreement was 
executed among the ISC, Reclamation, 
and the New Mexico CAP Entity (action 
proponent) for the purposes of paying 
Reclamation’s costs associated with 
preparation of the EIS. 

Pursuant to the National 
Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) of 
1969, as amended, 42 U.S.C. 4231–4347, 
a Notice of Intent to prepare the EIS for 
the NM Unit was published in the 
Federal Register on June 12, 2018 (83 
FR 27347). 

Publication of the Federal Register 
notice was followed by a public scoping 
period that ended on July 20, 2018. The 
Draft EIS was made available for public 
review and comment from April 24 to 
June 8, 2020. 

On June 18, 2020, the ISC voted to 
terminate the NEPA process for the NM 
Unit, and not fund Reclamation to 
complete the NEPA process. 

The parties went through a dispute 
resolution process for termination of the 
Interim Advance Funding Agreement, 
following the ISC’s decision. On 
October 15, 2020, the ISC, Reclamation, 
and the New Mexico CAP Entity 
terminated the Interim Advance 
Funding Agreement, which funded the 
NM Unit EIS process. 

Karl Stock, 
Acting Regional Director, Interior Region 8: 
Lower Colorado Basin, Bureau of 
Reclamation. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08511 Filed 4–22–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4332–90–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. 731–TA–1529 (Final)] 

Seamless Carbon and Alloy Steel 
Standard, Line, and Pressure Pipe 
From Czechia; Determination 

On the basis of the record 1 developed 
in the subject investigation, the United 
States International Trade Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’) determines, pursuant 
to the Tariff Act of 1930 (‘‘the Act’’), 
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2 86 FR 12909 (March 5, 2021). 

that an industry in the United States is 
materially injured by reason of imports 
of seamless carbon and alloy steel 
standard, line, and pressure pipe from 
Czechia, provided for in subheadings 
7304.19.10, 7304.19.50, 7304.31.60, 
7304.39.00, 7304.51.50, 7304.59.60, and 
7304.59.80 of the Harmonized Tariff 
Schedule of the United States, that have 
been found by the U.S. Department of 
Commerce (‘‘Commerce’’) to be sold in 
the United States at less than fair value 
(‘‘LTFV’’).2 

Background 

The Commission instituted this 
investigation effective July 8, 2020, 
following receipt of petitions filed with 
the Commission and Commerce by 
Vallourec Star, LP, Houston, Texas. The 
Commission scheduled the final phase 
of the investigation following 
notification of a preliminary 
determination by Commerce that 
imports of seamless carbon and alloy 
steel standard, line, and pressure pipe 
from Czechia were being sold at LTFV 
within the meaning of section 733(b) of 
the Act (19 U.S.C. 1673b(b)). Notice of 
the scheduling of the final phase of the 
Commission’s investigation and of a 
public hearing to be held in connection 
therewith was given by posting copies 
of the notice in the Office of the 
Secretary, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, Washington, DC, and by 
publishing the notice in the Federal 
Register of December 31, 2021 (85 FR 
86946). In light of the restrictions on 
access to the Commission building due 
to the COVID–19 pandemic, the 
Commission conducted its hearing 
through written testimony and video 
conference on March 4, 2021. All 
persons who requested the opportunity 
were permitted to participate. 

The Commission made this 
determination pursuant to § 735(b) of 
the Act (19 U.S.C. 1673d(b)). It 
completed and filed its determination in 
this investigation on April 19, 2021. The 
views of the Commission are contained 
in USITC Publication 5183 (April 2021), 
entitled Seamless Carbon and Alloy 
Steel Standard, Line, and Pressure Pipe 
from Czechia: Investigation No. 731– 
TA–1529 (Final). 

By order of the Commission. 

Issued: April 19, 2021. 

Lisa Barton, 

Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08442 Filed 4–22–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Drug Enforcement Administration 

[Docket No. DEA–820] 

Importer of Controlled Substances 
Application: Cardinal Health 

AGENCY: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Department of Justice. 
ACTION: Notice of application. 

SUMMARY: Cardinal Health has applied 
to be registered as an importer of basic 
class(es) of controlled substance(s). 
Refer to Supplemental Information 
listed below for further drug 
information. 

DATES: Registered bulk manufacturers of 
the affected basic class(es), and 
applicants therefore, may file written 
comments on or objections to the 
issuance of the proposed registration on 
or before May 24, 2021. Such persons 
may also file a written request for a 
hearing on the application on or before 
May 24, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments should 
be sent to: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Attention: DEA Federal 
Register Representative/DPW, 8701 
Morrissette Drive, Springfield, Virginia 
22152. All requests for a hearing must 
be sent to: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Attn: Administrator, 
8701 Morrissette Drive, Springfield, 
Virginia 22152. All requests for a 
hearing should also be sent to: (1) Drug 
Enforcement Administration, Attn: 
Hearing Clerk/OALJ, 8701 Morrissette 
Drive, Springfield, Virginia 22152; and 
(2) Drug Enforcement Administration, 
Attn: DEA Federal Register 
Representative/DPW, 8701 Morrissette 
Drive, Springfield, Virginia 22152. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with 21 CFR 1301.34(a), this 
is notice that on February 15, 2021 
Cardinal Health, 15 Ingram Boulevard, 
La Vergne, Tennessee 37086–3630, 
applied to be registered as an importer 
of the following basic class(es) of 
controlled substance(s): 

Controlled substance Drug 
code Schedule 

Nabilone ....................... 7379 II 

The company plans to import finished 
dosage unit products containing 
Nabilone for distribution. No other 
activity for this drug code is authorized 
for this registration. 

Approval of permit applications will 
occur only when the registrant’s 

business activity is consistent with what 
is authorized under 21 U.S.C. 952(a)(2). 

William T. McDermott, 

Assistant Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08537 Filed 4–22–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Drug Enforcement Administration 

[Docket No. DEA–821] 

Importer of Controlled Substances 
Application: Lipomed 

AGENCY: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Justice. 

ACTION: Notice of application. 

SUMMARY: Lipomed has applied to be 
registered as an importer of basic 
class(es) of controlled substance(s). 
Refer to Supplemental Information 
listed below for further drug 
information. 

DATES: Registered bulk manufacturers of 
the affected basic class(es), and 
applicants therefore, may file written 
comments on or objections to the 
issuance of the proposed registration on 
or before May 24, 2021. Such persons 
may also file a written request for a 
hearing on the application on or before 
May 24, 2021. 

ADDRESSES: Written comments should 
be sent to: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Attention: DEA Federal 
Register Representative/DPW, 8701 
Morrissette Drive, Springfield, Virginia 
22152. All requests for a hearing must 
be sent to: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Attn: Administrator, 
8701 Morrissette Drive, Springfield, 
Virginia 22152. All request for a hearing 
should also be sent to: (1) Drug 
Enforcement Administration, Attn: 
Hearing Clerk/OALJ, 8701 Morrissette 
Drive, Springfield, Virginia 22152; and 
(2) Drug Enforcement Administration, 
Attn: DEA Federal Register 
Representative/DPW, 8701 Morrissette 
Drive, Springfield, Virginia 22152. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with 21 CFR 1301.34(a), this 
is notice that on February 26, 2021, 150 
Cambridgepark Drive, Suite 705, 
Cambridge, Massachusetts 02140, 
applied to be registered as an importer 
of the following basic class(es) of 
controlled substance(s): 
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