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1 The record is defined in sec. 207.2(f) of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and Procedure (19 
CFR 207.2(f)). 

The Robert S. Peabody Museum of 
Archaeology is responsible for notifying 
the White Earth Band of the Minnesota 
Chippewa Tribe that this notice has 
been published. 

Dated: March 31, 2016. 
Melanie O’Brien, 
Manager, National NAGPRA Program. 
[FR Doc. 2016–10070 Filed 4–28–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4312–50–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. 731–TA–1314 
(Preliminary)] 

Phosphor Copper From Korea 

Determination 
On the basis of the record 1 developed 

in the subject investigation, the United 
States International Trade Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’) determines, pursuant 
to the Tariff Act of 1930 (‘‘the Act’’), 
that there is a reasonable indication that 
an industry in the United States is 
materially injured by reason of imports 
of phosphor copper from Korea, 
provided for in subheading 7405.00.10 
of the Harmonized Tariff Schedule of 
the United States, that are alleged to be 
sold in the United States at less than fair 
value (‘‘LTFV’’). 

Pursuant to section 207.18 of the 
Commission’s rules, the Commission 
also gives notice of the commencement 
of the final phase of its investigation. 
The Commission will issue a final phase 
notice of scheduling, which will be 
published in the Federal Register as 
provided in section 207.21 of the 
Commission’s rules, upon notice from 
the Department of Commerce 
(‘‘Commerce’’) of an affirmative 
preliminary determination in the 
investigation under section 733(b) of the 
Act, or, if the preliminary determination 
is negative, upon notice of an 
affirmative final determination in that 
investigation under section 735(a) of the 
Act. Parties that filed entries of 
appearance in the preliminary phase of 
the investigation need not enter a 
separate appearance for the final phase 
of the investigation. Industrial users, 
and, if the merchandise under 
investigation is sold at the retail level, 
representative consumer organizations 
have the right to appear as parties in 
Commission antidumping and 
countervailing duty investigations. The 
Secretary will prepare a public service 
list containing the names and addresses 

of all persons, or their representatives, 
who are parties to the investigation. 

Background 

On March 9, 2016, Metallurgical 
Products Company, West Chester, PA 
filed a petition with the Commission 
and Commerce, alleging that an industry 
in the United States is materially 
injured or threatened with material 
injury by reason of LTFV imports of 
phosphor copper from Korea. 
Accordingly, effective March 9, 2016, 
the Commission, pursuant to section 
733(a) of the Tariff Act of 1930 (19 
U.S.C. 1673b(a)), instituted antidumping 
duty investigation No. 731–TA–1314 
(Preliminary). 

Notice of the institution of the 
Commission’s investigation and of a 
public conference to be held in 
connection therewith was given by 
posting copies of the notice in the Office 
of the Secretary, U.S. International 
Trade Commission, Washington, DC, 
and by publishing the notice in the 
Federal Register of March 15, 2016 (81 
FR 13822). The conference was held in 
Washington, DC, on March 30, 2016, 
and all persons who requested the 
opportunity were permitted to appear in 
person or by counsel. 

The Commission made this 
determination pursuant to section 
733(a) of the Tariff Act of 1930 (19 
U.S.C. 1673b(a)). It completed and filed 
its determination in this investigation 
on April 25, 2016. The views of the 
Commission are contained in USITC 
Publication 4608 (May 2016), entitled 
Phosphor Copper from Korea: 
Investigation No. 731–TA–1314 
(Preliminary). 

Issued: April 26, 2016. 
By order of the Commission. 

Lisa R. Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2016–10055 Filed 4–28–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, Firearms 
and Explosives 

[OMB Number 1140–0091] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed eCollection 
eComments Requested; National 
Response Team Customer Satisfaction 
Survey 

AGENCY: Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, 
Firearms and Explosives, Department of 
Justice. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice 
(DOJ), Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, 
Firearms and Explosives (ATF), will 
submit the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until June 
28, 2016. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments 
especially on the estimated public 
burden or associated response time, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact 
Jennifer George, Fire Investigations and 
Arson Enforcement Division, ATF 
NCETR, Corporal Road, Building 3750 
Redstone Arsenal, Huntsville, Alabama 
35898 at: Jennifer.George@atf.gov 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 1140–0091 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Revision of a currently approved 
collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
National Response Team Customer 
Satisfaction Survey. 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 

Form number: None. 
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